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Title 40-Protection of the Environment
CHAPTER I--ENVIRONMENTAL

PROTECTION AGENCY
SUBCHAPTER N-EFFLUENT GUIDELINES AND

STANDARDS
PART 424-FERROALLOY MANUFACTUR-

ING POINT SOURCE CATEGORY
Subpart A-Open Electric Furnaces With

Wet Air Pollution Control Devices Sub-
category

Subpart B-Covered Electric Furnaces and
Other Smelting Operations With Wet Air
Pollution Control Devices Subcategory

Subpart C-Slag Processing Subcategory
On October 18, 1973 notice was pub-

lished in the FEDERAL REGISTER, (38 FR
29008), that the Environmental Protec-
tion Agency (EPA or Agency) was pro-
posing effluent limitations guidelines for
existing sources and standards of per-
formance and pretreatment standards
for new sources within the open electric
furnaces with wet air pollution control
devices subcategory, the covered electric
furnaces and other smelting operations
with wet air pollution control devices
subcategory and the slag processing sub-
category of the ferroalloy manufacturing
category of point sources.

The purpose of this notice is to estab-
lish final effluent limitations guidelines
for existing sources and standards of per-
formance and pretreatment standards
for new sources in the ferroalloy manu-
facturing category of point sources, by
amending 40 CFR Chapter I, Subchapter
N, to add a new Part 424. This final rule-
making is promulgated pursuant to sec-
tions 301, 304 (b) and (c), 306 (b) and
(c) and 307(c) of the Federal Water
Pollution Control Act, as amended (the
Act); (33 U.S.C. 1251, 1311, 1314 (b) and
(c), 1316 (b) and (c) and 1317(c)); 86
Stat. 816 et seq.; Pub. L. 92-500. Regula-
tions regarding cooling -water intake
structures for all categories of point
sources under section 316(b) of the Act
will be promulgated in 40 CFR 402.

In addition, the EPA is simultaneously
proposing a separate provision which
also appears in Part 31 of today's 1Ea-
ERAL REGISTER, stating the appli~ation of
the limitations and standards set forth
below to users of publicly owned treat-
ment works which are subject to pre-
treatment standards under section 307
(b) of the Act. The basis of that pro-
posed regulation is set forth in the as-
sociated notice of proposed rulemaking.

The legal basis, methodology and fac-
tual conclusions which support promul-
gation of this regulation were set forth in
substantial detail in the notice of public
review procedures published August 6,
1973 (38 FR 21202) and in the notice
of proposed rulemaking for the open
electric furnaces with wet air pollution
control devices subcategory, the covered
electric furnaces and other smelting op-
erations with wet air pollution control
devices subcategory and the slag process-
ing subcategory. In addition, the regula-
tions as proposed were supported-by two
other documents; (1) The document en-
titled "Development Document for Pro-
posed ,Effluent Limitations Guidelines
and New Source Performance Stand-
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ards for the Smelting and Slag Process-
ing Segments of the Ferroalloy Manu-
facturing Point Source Category" (Aug-
ust 1973) and (2) the document entitled
"Economic Analysis of Proposed Effluent
Guidelines, The Ferroalloys Industry"
(August, 1973). Both of these documents
were made available to the public and
circulated to interested persons at ap-
proximately the time of publication of
the notice of proposed rulemaking.

Interested persons were invited to par-
ticipate in the rulemaking by submitting
written comments within 30 days from
the date of publication. Prior public par-
ticipation in the form of solicited com-
ments and responses from the States,
Federal agencies, and other interested
parties were described in the preamble
to the proposed regulation. The EPA has
considered carefully all of the comments
received and a discussion of these com-
ments with the Agency's response thereto
follows in this document.

It should be noted that the production
of calcium carbide (although similar to
that for ferroaloys and often conducted
in the same plants) is not included in
these regulations for ferroalloys. Calcium
carbide is included in the regulations to
be promulgated under Part 415, Inor-
ganic Chemicals Manufacturing Indus-
try.

(a) Summary of comments. The fol-
lowing responded to the request for writ:-
ten comments contained in the preamble
to the proposed regulation: Union Car-
bide Corporation; Airco, Inc.; Ohio
Ferro-Alloy Corporation; Foote Mineral
Company; The Ferroalloys Association;
Chromium Mining and Smelting Corpo-
ration; Aroneties, Inc.: Colorado Depart-
ment of Public Health; United States
Water Resources Council; U.S. Atomic
Energy Commission; U.S. Department of
the Interior; U.S. Department of Com-
merce and U.S. Department of Health,
Education, and Welfare.

Each of the comments received was
carefully reviewed and analyzed. The fol-
lowing is a summary of the significant
comments and the Agency's response fo
them.

(1) The commentors noted that the
treatment system *for scrubber waste-
water was not demonstrated in its en-
tirety in any one plant, and that there-
fore one cannot assign costs to it.
Additionally, the comment was made that
the concentrations upon which the pro-
posed guidelines were based were lower
than those found in the plants observed
during the survey.

Although the treatment systems pro-
posed for best practicable control tech-
nology currently available, best available
technology economically achievable and
new sources is not presently in use In
any one plant, the various modules of
which they are comprised are in use in
this industry, or in similar industries.
As the -industry's trade association
pointed out In its comments, "[1little
Information Is available on water pol-
lution from ferroalloy plants and on
treatment of waste water from them
* * *. Minimal effort has been directed
toward * * * perfecting control tech-
nology for those pollutants that are

generated." Because of this-background
(or lack thereof), It was necessary to syn-
thesize a tretment system which would
work for this industry, from technologies
utilized In this and similar industries.
Because the treatment modules are in
use, a cost estimate can be made for
the total system which is reasonably ac-
curate. Additionally, in the Development
Document, examples of such modules or
systems in similar Industries are dis-
cussed in further detail than previously,

.Deflnition of what constitutes "best
practicable" technology for many indus-
tries involves, at first, a general review
of the industry to determine the best
technologies being practiced In the in-
dustry. Then, after closer review and
investigation of these technologies, the
"best practicable" technology would be
assessed as the average of the best,
though not necessarily the best tech-
nology, after taking into account Infor-
mation relating to other factors spelled
out in the Act. In those industries where
present treatment is uniformly inade-
quate, a higher degree of treatment than
is presently practiced may be required,
based on a comparison with existing
treatments for similar wastes in other
industries. Factors for determining the
"best available" technology are similar,
except that rather than assessing the
average of the best, the focus would be
on the very best technology currently
in use or demonstrably achievable.

Under this analysis of the statutory
standard, it is the opinion of the Agency
that it is not necessary that "best prac-
ticable" technology be currently in use
as a single treatment. As applied to the
ferroally industry, the methodology em-
ployed resulted In sufficient data to sup-
port the resulting limitations, and is
completely consistent with the statutory
requirements.

(2) The relationship between the 30
day average limitations and the 24 hour
maximum limitations was questioned.

The 30 day average limitations are by
no means the absolute lowest values at-
tainable by the indicated technology,
but represent 'values which can be
readily controlled around on a day to
day basis. The 24 hour maximum limita-
tion was established so as not to exceed
these 30 day values by more than a fac-
tor of two. In the absence of sufficient
performance data from the Industry to
establish a factor between the two limi-
tations on a statistical basis, a factor of
two was chosen after taking Into con-
sideration the operational variability in-
volved. This factor of two is considered
to be generous.

(3) It was remarked that some plants
might be forced to lower their produc-
tion rates, since recirculated non-
contact-cooling water would be of
higher temperature than once-through.
It was also remarked that data to per-
mit determination of heat content (as
described In the proposed regulation)
was not obtained during plant sampling.

In the interests of uniformity with the
guidelines for other industries, no regu-
lation for the control of non-contact
cooling water will be promulgated at this
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time. However, non-contact cooling
water for all industries will be studied
in the future and standards for non-
contact cooling water will then be
established.

(4) The costs of treatment and fa-
cilities were thought by some corn-
mentors to be low, particularly when a
plant might have to retrofit such facili-
ties. They were also thought to be low
because the costs might be "book value",
or a percentage of the total facility,
rather than actual costs. It was also
noted that the costs are not those which
would actually be incurred by a plant

.presently requiring such Installations,
since the costs are given in August,
1971 dollars. It was also thought that the
costs did not include land costs.

The costs as given are generous esti-
mates of those which may be incurred.
Costs such s those for demolition, etc.,
which might be necessary for installa-
tion of treatment in an existing plant,
were not included, since those costs
would be highly variable from plant to
plant Also highly variable will be the
cost of land. However, it is believed that
none of the seven plants in the industry
which were visited and which utilized
wet air pollution control systems will be
forced to purchase land for water pol-
lution control purposes. Because of the
variability in cost and the belief that no
plant in the industry will be required
to purchase such land, this cost was not
included. Inflation, has of course, af-
fected the actual costs, so that such a
system if actually built now would be
somewhat more expensive than if built
in August 1971.

(5) Some commentors objected to the
use of limitations on a gross, rather than
net basis. It was remarked, for example,
that the amounts to be removed and the
cost of removal are dependent upon the
intake levels, that discharge levels could
not be met because of the intake levels,
etc.

If not otherwise specified, the effluent
limitation numbers in this regulation will
be applied as absolute discharge limita-
tions. The use of such absolute limite.-
tions is generally appropriate since the
concentration of a pollutant remaining
after the application of a given treat-
ment technology is relatively independ-
ent of minor variations in the pollutant
concentration in the waste or the source
of the pollutant. EPA intends to amend
the NPDES regulations to take Into ac-
count, when appropriate, pollutants al-
ready existing in the stream, so that in
certain cases an effluent limitation may
be adjusted to take into account pollu-
tants entering with a discharger's supply
providing the water is withdrawn from
the same source into which it is dis-
charged- If the source Is other than the
receiving waterbody, the effluent stand-
ards will be applied as absolute limita-
tions without adjustment.

(6) It was remarked that ranges of
numbers (e., limitations) are needed
for flexibility in writing the permit, so
that variations in age, sizeiocation, etc.,
may receive allowances. It was also noted

that the location (climate) of a plant
could have an effect on the wastewater
treatment syzstem' performance.

Range Is provided for, as am the other
factors, by the breaking up of the In-
dustry into subcategories with different
effluent limitations. The factor of bize has
been taken into account when writing

-the permit on a production basis. Addi-
tionally, the factor of location (climate)
can be rectified when designing the treat-
ment stem. A special provision allow-
ing flexibility in the application of the
limitations representing best practicable
control technology currently available
has been added, to account for special
circumstances applicable to individual
dischargers that may not have been ade-
quately taken into account when the
regulations were developed.

(7) Some commentors felt that the
data base was insufficient for the pro-
mulgation of guidelines and that not
enough time was covered to be truly
representative of year-round operating
conditions.

Within the required time constraints
for the collection of data, it was Im-
possible to expand the samplinug and
analytical work to cover more plants, or
even to collect more samples from the
same plants. However, it is felt that the
overall type sampling performed pro-
vides a good representation of waste-
waters and that this data, together with
the contractor's many year. of experl-
ence in water and waste" treatment in
similar industries, provides an adequate
basis for the regulation. The only water
usage at the vast majority of plants in
the ferroalloys industry is for non-
contact cooling. Only one third of the
electric furnaces In the Industry use wet
air pollution control methods. The eco-
nomic impact study noted that nine
plants (out of 22) use wet methods. Of
these nine, six (or 2/3rds) were visited.
and five sampled--a rather high level of
coverage. The data thus obtained is the
best available from any source at this
time.

(8) Some comments were received re-
garding the testing methods and pro-
cedures followed.

The analytical methods used for
measuring the pollutants in the various
samples are now reported In the Develop-
ment Document. As to any Inaccuracy in
the flow measurements, these measure-
ments were the best which could be ob-
tained during the sampling promim.

(9) Many commentors objected, come
very strenuously, to the requirement of
zero discharge of pollutants for new
sources of open electric furnaces, to be
achieved by the use of dry, rather than
wet, dust collectlop systems. The point
was raised that It w1a "unreasonably re-
strictive for the Environmental Protec-
tion Agency to specify a particular typo
of emission control equipment " *0.

The proposed guidelines and stand-
ards have been rewritten to permit a dis-
charge. The reason for this is that flexi-
bility in selecting air pollution control
equipment is believed to be necesary,
and application of the best practicable
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and best available technologies to wet
scrubber emission control systems will
not effect a zero discharge.

(10) It was remarked that the cost
of water pollution cleanup may cause
the premature phasing-out of older,
smaller units, and that the combined
economlo impact of air and water pol-
lution control would be very large, and
that this Impact would be borne by the
plants without [air and water Pollution
control] equipment.

The economic Impact study indicates
that no plant closings will be caused by
the cost of waste water treatment. Since
no plants will close, any smaller older
furnaces prematurely phased out will be
replaced by the more profitable larger
furnaces. This has been general practice
in the Industry in the past few years.
The combined cost of air and water pol-
lution control could be large, particu-
larly for those plants not presently con-
trolling their air emissions. However,
most or all of these plants utilize open
furnaces, and will almost certainly in-
stall baghouses for air pollution control
because of the present cost favorability.
The eight plants which are reported in
the economic impact study as being the
most Impacted by the water pollution
control regulations are those which have
already taken a responsible attitude to-
ward air pollution by installing control
devices. They would thus not incur costs
for air Pollution control systems.

(11) Some commentors felt that the
standards were more restrictive (for
1977 and 1993) for open furnaces than
for covered furnaces.

The standards are based upon water
usage (per Mwh) and concentrations. Al-
though the water usage for scrubbers
cleaning gases from open furnaces was
expected to be higher than for covered
furnaces (since scrubber water usage is
generally a function of gas volume and
open furnaces may emit up to 50 times
more gas than do covered furnaces), the
water use wms found to be slightly less
during the sampling survey. Very few
open furnac utilizing wet air pollution
control systems were found, compared to
the number of such systems on covered
furnaces. Most open furnaces were ei-
ther uncontrolled or used baghouses. It
was not thought to be reasonable to base
the limitation on the water usage at
plants using electrostatic precipitators
or steam/hot water scrubbers, since the
water usage of these systems is very
much less than those of venturi scrub-
bers. Since the field data indicates that
water usage on open furnace scrubbers
is less than for covered furnace scrub-
hers, a more restrictive standard Is Jus-
tified.

(12) It was pointed out that the blor-
dow n from a s!a-g concentrator at plant
F (which was originally reported to flow
to a clozed lagoon) flows to a cinder
dump. On this basis, it w=s siggested
that the limitation of zero discharge for
1983 and new sources is not applicable.

Although the plant in question states
that there is no discharge from the slag
concentration operation after the blow-
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down reaches the cinder dump, a reex-
amination of the facts in this case leads
us to believe that zero discharge for this.
category may not be uniformly achievea-
ble. Therefore, the limitations for this
category have been changed to allow for
discharge of blowdown from slag proc-
essing operations after treatment.

(13) One commentor expressed con-
cern that "disruptions or losses in U.S.
productive capacity will increase our re-
liance on imports and adversely affect
our international balance of payments."

Two factors are expected to be the
major determinants of future ferroalloy
imports versus the amount processed do-
mestically from foreign ores. First, the-.
U.S. depends almost entirely upon im-
ported ores (chrome, nickel, manganese,
tungsten, etc.) to produce ferroalloys.
The countries exporting these ores are
beginning to develop ferroalloy process-
ing capabilities. Once they have devel-
oped sufficient capacity, it is likely that
they will attempt to shift the U.S. pur-
chases from ores to ferroalloys. Second,
the world wide demand for ferroalloys
based on sustained high levels of steel
production may affect the foreign ferro-
alloys supply that has traditionally con-
stituted a significant portion of our con-
sumption.

In summary, the effects of pollution
control costs upon foreign trade are ex-
pected to be insignificant in the context
of the more fundamental changes ex-
pected in the world wide ferroalloys
supply/demand situation.

(14) The -comment was made that
"conclusions based on average figures
will understate the economic impact on
smaller plants since the analysis is heav-
ily weighted" toward the assessment of
impact on large plants." It was also ques-
tioned whdther the eight plants that
must install effluent controls by 1977
were small plants and whether those
eight plants would be able to pass on
the costs through price increases.

The contractor analyzed the incre-
mental costs for various size plants and
found the costs to be directly (linearly)
related to production capacity over a
broad range of furnace and/or plant
size. Thus, the impact on profitability is
unrelated to company size, and it can-
not be construed that smaller firms will
be more adversely affected than larger
firms. Half of tha plants requiring efflu-
ent control investments by'1977 are
owned by one firm. Since the combined
output from those plants represent one
third of the U.S. production, it is rea-
sonable to assume that it is in a position
to be a leader in price increases.

(15) Some correspondents endorsed
the proposal made to the Administrator
by the Effluent Standards and Water
Quality Information Advisory Commit-
tee that a significantly different ap-
proach be taken in the development of
effluent guidelines.

The committee's proposal is under
evaluation as a contribution toward fu-
ture refinements on guidelines for some
industries. The Committee has indicated
that its proposed methodology could not

be developed in sufficient time to be
available for the current phase of guide-
line promulgation, which is proceeding
according to a court-ordered schedule.
Its present state of development does not
provide sufficient evidence to warrant the
Agency's delaying issuance of any stand-
ard in hopes that an alternative ap-
proach might be preferable.

(b) Revision of the proposed regula-
tion prior to promulgation. As a result of
public comments and continuing review
and evaluation of the proposed regula-
tion by the EPA, the following changes
have been made in the regulation.

-(1) In the interests of uniformity with
the other industry guidelin'es, the non-
contact cooling water subcategory of this
industry has been eliminated. Standards
for noncontact cooling water for all in-
dustries will be promulgated in the
future.

(2) Orthophosphate has been deleted
as a pollutant parameter for the open
electric furnaces with wet air pollution
control devices subcategory (Subpart A)
and the covered electric furnaces and
other smelting operations with wet air
pollution control devices subcategory
(Subpart B). Phenols have been deleted
as a pollutant parameter from Subpart
A, and oil has been deleted as a pollutant
parameter from all subcategories. These
changes result from a reexamination of
the raw data collected by the Agency's
contractor and consideration of the costs
of monitoring.

(3) A discharge from new open elec-
tric furnaces is now allowed. The rea-
son for this is that flexibility in selecting
air pollution control equipment is be-
lieved to be necessary, and aijplication of
the best practicable and best available
technologies to wet scrubber emission
control systems will not effect a zero dis-
charge. This also allows plants to select
air pollution control systems which are
the most efficient and economic for that
particular plant.

(4) Discharge of blowdown from slag
processing operations (for 1983 and new
'sources) is now permitted. This results
from an evaluation of data submitted by
industry and a closer look at the data
collected by the Agency's contractor.

(5) The standards for hexavalent
chromium in Subpart A and B have been
increased after consideration of the
sensitivity of the analytical method.

(6) Section 304(b) (1) (B) of the Act
provides for "guidelines" to implement
the uniform national standards of sec-
tion 301(b) (1) (A). Thus Congress rec-
ognized that some flexibility was neces-
sary in order to take into account the
complexity of the industrial world with
respect to the practicability of pollution
control technology. In conformity with
the Congressional intent and in recogni-
tion of the possible failure of these regu-
lations to account for all factors bearing
on the practicability of control technol-
ogy, it was concluded that some provi-
sion was needed to authorize flexibility in
the strict application of the limitations
contained in the regulation where re-
quired by special circumstances applt-

cable to individual dischargers. Accord-
ingly, a provision allowing flexibility In
the application of the limitations repre-
senting best practicable control technol-
ogy currently available has been added
to each subpart, to account for special
circumstances that may not have been
adequately accounted for when these
regulations were developed.

(c) Economic impact. Tho above listed
changes will not sigificantly affect the
conclusions of the economic study of the
proposed regulations. The change in the
standard for hexavalent chromium and
the deletion of some parameters should
not affect the cost of the treatment sys-
tem. Dropping of the noncontact cool-
ing water segment of this Industry from
the present promulgation will result In a
reduction of investment costs of at least
$1.2 million dollars for 1977 and 1983.
This represents about 8 percent of the
total calculated investment for the en-
tire industry. While this "savings" has a
slight effect on the economic Impact from
this regulation, it should be kept in mind
that noncontact cooling water will be
regulated in the future, and some addi-
tional investment may be necessary. Al-
lowing for discharge of blowdown from
zlag processing operations should also re-
sult in very minor savings.

"(d) Cost-benefit analysis. The detri-
mental effects of the constituents of waste
waters now discharged by point sources
within the smelting and slag processing
segments of the ferroalloy manufactur-
ing point source category are discussed in
Section VI of the report entitled "De-
velopment Document for Effluent Limita-
tions Guidelines for the Smelting and
Slag Processing Segments of the Fer-
roally Manufacturing Point Source
Category" (February, 1974). It Is not
feasible to quantify in economic terms,
particularly on a national basis, the costs,
resulting from the discharge of these
pollutants to our Nation's waterways.
Nevertheless, as indicated in Section VI,
the pollutants discharged have substan-
tial and damaging impacts on the quality
of water and therefore on its capacity to
support healthy populations of wildlife,
fish and other aquatic wildlife and on its
suitability for industrial, recreational and
drinking water supply uses.

The total cost of implementing the
effluent limitations guidelines includes
the direct capital and operating costs of
the pollution, control technology em-
ployed to achieve compliance and the
indirect economic and environmental
costs identified in Section VIII and in
the supplementary report entitled "Eco-
nomic Analysis of Proposed Effluent
Guidelines, The Ferroalloys Industry"
(August, 1973). Implementing the efflu-
ent limitations guidelines will substan-
tially reduce the environmental harm
which would otherwise be attributable to
the continued discharge of polluted

'waste waters from existing and newly
constructed plants in the ferroalloys
industry. The Agency believes that the
benefits of thus reducing the pollutants
discharged justify the associated costs
which, though substantial in absolute
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terms, represent a relatively small per-
centage of the total capital investment
in the industry.

(e) -Publication of information on
processes, procedures, or operating
methods which result in the elimination
or reduction of the discharge of pollut-
ants. In conformance with the require-
ments of section 304(c) of the Act, a
manual entitled, '"Development Docu-
ment for Effluent Limitations Guidelinec
and New Source Performance Standards
for the Smelting and Slag Processing
Segments of the Ferroalloy Manufactur-
ing Point Source -Category," has been
published and is available for purchase
from the Government Printing Ofice,
Washington, D.C., 20401 for a nominal
fee.

(f) Final rulemaking. In consideration
of the foregoing, 40 CFR Chapter I, Sub-
chapter N is hereby amended by adding
a new Part 424, Ferroalloy Manufactur-
ing Point Source Category, to read as set
forth below. This final regulation Is
promulgated as set forth below and shall
be effective April 23,1974.

Dated: February 8,1974.
RUSSFAL E. TRAwI,

Administrator.

PART 424-FERROALLOY MANUFACTUR-
ING POINT -SOURCE CATEGORY

Subpart A-Open Electric Furnaces With Wet Air
- Pollution Control Devices Subcategory

See.
424.10 Applicability; description of the open

electric furnaces with wet air pol-
lution control devices subcategory.

424.11 Specialized definitions. -
424.12 Effluent limitations guidelines rep-

resenting the degree of effluent
reduction attainable by the appll-
cation of the best practicable con-
trol technology currently available.

424.13 Effluent limitations guidelines rep-
resenting the degree of effluent
reduction attainable by the appU-
cation of the best available tech-
nology eonomically achievable.

424.14 [Reserved]
424.15 Standards of performance for new

sources.
424.16 Pretreatment standards for new

sources.

Subpart B--Covered Electric Furnaces and Other
Smelting Operations With Wet Air Pollution
Control Devices Subcategory

424.20 Applicability;, description ofthe cov-
ered electric furnaces and other
smelting operations with wet air
pollution control devices subcate-
gory.

424.21 Specialized definitions.
424.22 Effluent limitations guidelines rep-

resenting the degree of effluent
reduction attainable by the appli-
Eation of the best practicable con-
trol technology currently available.

424.23 Effluent limitations guidelines" rep-
resenting the degree of effluent
reduction attainable by the applI-
cation 6f the best available tech-
nology economically achievable.

42124 [Reserved]
42 .25 Standards of performance for new

sources.
42426 Pretreatment standards for new

sources.

Subpart C-Slag Processlng Subcategory
sec.

Subpart A--Open Electric Furnaces With
Wet Air Pollution Control Devices Sub-
category

§ 424.10 Applicability; description of
the open electric furnaces with wet
air pollution control devices subcate-
gory.

The provisions of this subpart are ap-
plicable to discharges resulting from the
smelting of ferroalloys in open electric
furnaces with wet air pollution control
devices. This subcategory includes those
electric furnaces of such construction or
configuration that the furnace off-gases
are burned above the furnace charge
level by air drawn into the system. After
combustion the gases are cleaned In a
wet air Pollution control device, such as
a scrubber, an electrostatic precipitator
with water or other aqueous sprays, etc.
The provisions of this subpart are not
applicable to noncontact cooling water
or to those electric furnaces which are
covered, closed, sealed, or semi-covered
and in which the furnace off-gases are
not burned prior to collection (regulated
in Subpart B).
§ 424.11 Specialized definitions.

For the purpose of this subpart:
(a) Except as provided below, the gen-

eral definitions, abbreviations and meth-
ods of analysis set forth In 40 CFR 401
shall apply to this subpart..

(b) The term ' wh" shall mean meg-
awatt hour(s) of electrical energy con-
sumed In the smelting process (furnace
power consumption).
§ 424.12 Effluent liniations guidelines

representing the degree of effluent
reduction attainable by the applica.
tion of the best practicable control
technology currently available.

(a) In establishing the limitations set
forth in this section, EPA took into ac-
count all information It was able to col-
lect, develop and sollcit with respect to
factors (such as age and size of plant,
raw materials, manufacturing processes,
products produced, treatment technology
available, energy requirements and costs)
'which can affect the industry subcate-
gorIzation and effluent levels establllhed
It is, however, possible that data which
would affect these limitations have not

424.30 Applicability: description of the nag
processing subcategory.

424C31 Specialized definitions.
424.32 Effluent limitations guidelines rep-

resenting the degree of eMuent
reduction attainable by the
application of the bes;t practicable
control technology currently avall-
able.

424.33 Effluent limitations guldellnes repre-
senting the degree of efluent
reduction attainable by the ap-
plcation of the best available
technology Lconomlcally acblev-
able.

42434 [Reserved)
424.35 Standards of performance for new

sources.
4241.36 Pretreatment ztandards for new

sources.
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been available and, a& a result, these
limitations should be adjusted for cer-
tain plants in this ndustry.An Individual
discharger or other Interested person
may submit; evidence to the Regional
Administrator (or to the State, if the
State has the authority to issue NPDES
permits) that factors relating to the
equipment or facilities Involved, the
process applied, or other such factors
related to such discharger are funda-
mentally different from the factors
considered In the establishment of
the guidelines. On the basis of such
evidence or other available Informa-
tion, the Regional Administrator (or
the State) will make a written find-
ing that such factors are or are
not findamentally different for that
facility compared to those specified in
the Development Document. If such fun-
damentally different factors are found to
exist, the Regional Administrator or the
State shall establish for the discharger
eilluent limitations In the NPDES permit
either more or less stringent than the
limitations established herein, to the ex-
tent dictated by such fundamentally dif-
ferent factors. Such limitations must be
approved by the Administrator of the
Environmental Protection Agency. The
Administrator may approve or disap-
prove such limitations, specify other
limitations, or initiate proceedings to
revise these regulations.

(b) The following limitations estab-
lish the quantity or quality of pollutants
or pollutant properties, controlled by this
section, which may be discharged by a
point source subject to the provisions of
this subpart after application of the best
practicable control technology currently
available:

Effluent limitatfes

Zilutnt Averse of
chanru-tCrLiI: M1axiimum for daily vaires rcr

ay2 day 30 cmrecutive
days hal'l rll

exeed-

]Ieid u kgiuwh

0.310 0.19O
C'mmlnlm totaL(. .CC0032

frC ............ . CCO W2

Ch-~u ,.L_ .014 .C3,7
Witbin the rzcrg 6.0 to 9.0

ZrZ!!b unlt3Ib.?Mub

T2r3 iu ...... . ... . .0147011
Chromilain VL....--- .014 A.

pH.............. Within tin ran-g? C.0 to 9.0

§ 424.13 Effluent limitations guidelines
representing the degree of effluent
reduction attainable by the applica-
tion of the best available technology
economically achievable.

The following limitations establish the
quantity or quality of pollutants or pol-
lutaut properties, controlled by this sec-
tion, which may be discharged by a point
Bource subject to the provisions of this
subpart after application of the best
available technology economically
achievable:
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Effluent limitations

Effluent Average of
characteristic Maximum for daily values foe

any 1 day 30 consecutive
days shall not

exceed-

Metric units kg~lwh

T88 ---------------- 0.024 0.012
Chromium totaL._ .00 .00W4
Chromium VI ...... . 00003 .00001
Manganese total .... .008 .0039
pH ----------------- Within the range 6.0 to 9.0

English Units lb/MAwh

TSB ----------- 0.052 0.026
Chromium total... . .0017 .0009
Chromium.VL ..... .0002 .0001
Manganese total.... . .017 .0080
pH ----------------- Within the range 6.0 to 9.0

§ 424.14 [Reserved]
§ 424.15 Standards of performance for

now sources.

The following standards of perform-
ance establish the quantity or quality of
pollutants or pollutant properties, con-
trolled by this section, which may be dis-
charged by a new source subject to the
provisions of this subpart:

Effluent limitations

Effluent aAverge of
characteristic Maximum for daily values for

any 1 day 30 consecutive
days shall notexceed-

Metric units kg/Mesh

TO .---------------- 0.024 0.012
Chromium total ... .0008 .00M
Chromium VI. ..... .00008 .00004
Manganese total ... .00 .00339
pH ----------------- Within the range 6.0 to 9.0

English units lb/Mwh

TS ---------------- 0.052 0.026
Chromium totaL... . .0017 .0009
Chromium VI ----- .0002 .0001
Manganese total.... . .017 .0086
pH ---------------- Within the range 6.0 to 9.0

§ 424.16 Pretreatment standards for
new sources.

The pretreatment standards under
section 307(c) of the Act for a source
within the open electric furnaces with
wet air pollution control devices sub-
category, which is a user of a publicly
owned treatment works (and which
would be a new source subject to section
306 of the Act, if it were to discharge
pollutants to the navigable waters), shall
be the standard set forth in Part 128 of
this chapter except that, for the purpose
of this section, § 128.133 of this chapter
shall be amended to read as follows:

In addition to the prohibitions set forth
in 40 CFR 128.131, the pretreatment standard
for incompatible pollutants Introduced Into
a publicly owned treatment works shall be
the standard of performance for new sources
specified In 40 CFR 424.15; provided that, if
the publicly owned treatment works which
receives the pollutants is committed, In its
NPDES permit, to remove a specified per-
centage of any incompatible pollutant, the
pretreatment standard applicable to users of
such treatment works phall, except in the
case of standards providing for no discharge

of pollutants, be correspondingly reduced In
stringency for that pollutant.

Subpart B-- Cvered Electric Furnaces and
Other Smelting Operations With Wet Air
Pollution Control Devices Subcategory

§ 424.20 Applicability; description 'of
the covered electric furnaces and
other smelting operations with wet
air pollution control devices subcate-
gory.

The provisions of this subpart are ap-
plicable to discharges resulting from the
smelting of ferroalloys in covered -elec-
tric furnaces or other smelting opera-
tions, not elsewhere included in this part,
with wet air pollution control devices.
This subcategory includes those electric
furnaces of such construction or configu-
ration (known as covered, closed, sealed,
semi-covered or semi-closed furnaces)
that the furnace off-gases are not burned
prior to collection and cleaning, and
which off-gases are cleaned after collec-
tion in a wet air pollution control device
such As a scrubber, 'wet' baghouse, etc.
This subcategory also includes those non-
electric furnace smelting operations,
such as exothdrmlc (i.e., aluminothermic
or slicothermic) smelting, ferromanga-
nese refining, etc., where these are con-
trolled for air pollution by wet air- pollu-
tion control devices. This subcategory
does not include noncontact cooling
water or those furnaces which utilize dry
dust collection techniques, such as dry
baghouses.

§ 424.21 Specialized definitions.
For the purpose of this subpart:
(a) Except as provided below, the gen-

eral deflnitions,'abbreviations and meth-
ods of analysis set forth in Part 401 of
this chapter shall apply to this subpart.

(b) The term "Mwh" shall mean
megawatt hour(s) of electrical energy
consumed in the smelting process (fur-
nace power consumption).
§ 424.22 Effluent limitations guidelines

representing the degree of effluent
reduction attainable by the applica.
tion of the best practicable control
technology currently available.

(a) In establishing the limitations sdt
forth in this section, EPA took into ac-
count all information it was able to col-
lect, develop and solicit with respect to
factors (such as age and size of plant,
raw materials, manufacturing processes,
products produced, treatment technol-
ogy available, energy requirements and
costs) which can affect the industry
subcategorlzation and effiluent levels
established. It is, however, possible that
data which would affect these limitations
have not been available and, as a result,
these limitations should be adjusted for
certain plants in this industry. An in-
dividual discharger or other Interested
person may submit evidence to the Re-
gional Administrator (or to the State,
if the State has the authority to issue
NPDES permits) that factors relating
to the equipment or facilities involved,
the process applied, or other such factors
related to such discharger are funda-

mentally different from the factors con-
sidered in the establishment of the
guidelines. On the basis of such evidence
or other available information, the Re-
gional Administrator (or the State) will
make a written finding that such factors
are or are not fundamentally different
for that facility compared to those speci-
fied in the Development Document. If
such fundamentally different factors are
found to exist, the Regional Administra-
tor or the State shall establish for the
discharger effluent limitations in the
NPDES permit either more or less strin-
gent than the limitations established
herein, to the extent dictated by such
fundamentally different factors, Such
limitations must be approved by the Ad-
ministrator of the Environmental Pro-
tection Agency. The Administrator may
approve or disapprove such limitations,
specify other limitations, or initiate pro-
ceedings to revise these regulations.

(b) The following limitations estab-
lish the quantity or quality of pollutants
or pollutant properties, controlled by
this section, which may be discharged by
a point source subject to the provisions
of this subpart after application of the
best practicable control technology cur-
rently available:

Efiluent limitations

Effluent Average of
characteristio Maximum for daily value for

any 1 day 30 consecutive
days shali not

exced-

Metric units kg/Mwh

TSS ---------------- - 0.419 0. 209
Chromium totaL.. .0 03 .O0
Chromiuram ..... .0003 .0001
Manaanece total.... . 0M1 .012
Cyanide total ...... . t .00
Phenols ..... . .000 .001
pH ----------------- Within the range 0 to 9.0

English unit lb6wh

TSS ----------------- M0.022 0.401
Chromium, total... . .018 .00D
Chromium VL... .0018 .0009
Manganese total_ .11 02
Cydnide total -. 009 .003
Phenols ............. 013 . 01
pH ----------------- Within the range 0.0 to 9,0

Provided, however, That for nonelec-
tric furnace smelting processes, the units
of the effluent limitations set forth In
this section shall be read as "kg/kkg of
product (lb/ton of products", rather than
"kg/Mwh (lb/Mwh) ", and the limita-
tions (except for pH) shall be three (3)
times those listed In the table in this'
section.
§ 424.23 Effluent limitations guidelines

representing the degree of effluent
reduction attainable by, the applica.
tion of the best available technology
economically achievable.

The following limitations establish the
quantity or quality of pollutants or pol-
lutant properties, controlled by this sec-
tion, which may be discharged by a
point source subject to the provisions
of this subpart after application of the
best available technology economically
achievable:
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Effluent limitations

Effluent ATenge of
characteristic Maximum for da ylues for

any 1 day 30 consecutive
days shll not-exceed-

Metric units kg/Mwh
TS ....... 0. 032 0. 016

Chromium tol... .031 .0
Chromum vL.... . .000 .0m
M anese total.... . .011 .03

Cynde ot . .0005 - .D3
Phenols --------. 00.1 .0W2
pH ----------------- Within the range 6.0 to 9.0

English units lbJMwh

TSS .. 0.071 0.035
Chromium total-... . .002 .0012
ChromiumVL --. 0002 .0D01
Manganese total.... . 023 .012-
Cyanide .otal.001 .0006
Phenols .0009 .0005
PH ..------------ Within the range 0.0 to 9.0

Provi&d, however,. That for nonelec-
tric furnace smelting processes, the units
of the effluent limitations set forth in
this section shall be read as "kg/kkg of
product (b/ton of product)", rather
than "kg/Mwh (lb/Mwh)", and the
limitations (except for pH) shall be three
(3) times those listed in the table in this
section.
§ 424.24 [Reserved]
§ 424.25 Standards of performance for

new sources.

The following standards of perform-
ance establish the quantity or quality of
pollutants or pollutant properties, con-
trolled by this section, which may be dis-
charged by a new source subject-to the
provisions of this subpart:

Effluent limitaions

Effluent Average of
characteristic Maximum for daily values for

any 1 day 30 consecutive
days shall not

exceed-

Metric units kg-.wh

TSS -- ...------------ -0.032 0.016
Chromium total.-.- .031 .0005
Chromium V--. .0001 .0.005
Manganes total.... . .011 .035
Cyanide totaL ..... .0005 .003
Phenols ............. 0004 .002
pH_ ............... i-- Wthin the range 0.0 to 9.0

English units lbJMwh

TSS ---------------- 0.071 0.035
Chromium total. .... 0 .0012
Chromium VL --. 002 .0001
Manganese total.... . 023 .012
Cyanide total___ .001 .0300
Phenols ............. 0009 .035
pH_ ..- - _- ------ Within the range 6.0 to 9.0

Provded, however, That for nonelec-
tric furnace smelting processes, the units
of the effluent limitations set forth in this
section shall be read as "kg/kkg of prod-
uct (lb/ton of product)", rather than
"kg/Mwh (lb/Mwh) ", and the limitations
(except for pH) shall be three (3) times
those listed in the table in this section.
§ 424.26 Pretreatment standards for

new sources.

The pretreatment standards under sec-
tion 307(c) of the Act for a source within

the covered electric furnaces and other
smelting operations with wet air pollu-
tiot control devices subcategory, which
is a user of a publicly owned treatment
works (and which would be a new source
subject to section 306 of the Act, if It
were to discharge pollutants to the navi-
gable waters), shall be the standard set
forth in Part 128 of this chapter, except
that, for the purpose of this section,
§ 128.133 of this chapter, shall be
amended to read as follows:

In addition to the prohibitions ret forth In
40 CFR 128.131, the pretreatment standard
for incompatible pollutants introduced into a
publicly owned treatment works hball be
the standard of performance for new cource
specified in 40 CFR -4.25; provided that, if
the publicly owned treatment works which
receives the pollutants Is committed. In Its
NPDES permit, to remove a specified per-
centage of any incompatible pollutant, the
pretreatment standard applicable to users of
such treatment works shall, except In the
case of standards providing for no discharge
of pollutants, be correspondingly reduced In
stringency for that pollutant.
Subpart C-Slag Processing Subcategory
§424.30 Applicability; description of

the slag processing subcategory.
The provisions of this subpart are ap-

plicable to discharges resulting from
slag processing, wherein (1) the residual
metallic values in the furnace slag are
recovered via concentration for return
to the furnace, or (2) the slag is
"shotted" for other further use.
§ 424.31 Specialized definitions.

For the purpose of this subpart:
(a) Except as provided below, the gen-

eral definitions, abbreviations and meth-
ods of analysis set forth in Part 401 of
this chapter shall apply to this subpart.

§ 424.32 Effluent limitations guidelines
representing the degree of effluent
reduction attainable by tie applica-
tion of the best practicable control
technology currently available.

(a) In establishing the limitations set
forth in this section, EPA took Into ac-
count all information it was able to col-
lect, develop and solicit with respect to
factors (such as age and size of plant,
raw materials, manufacturing processes,
products produced, treatment technology
available, energy requirements and costs)
which can affect the industry subcate-
gorization and effluent levels established.
It is, however, possible that data which
would affect these limitations have not
been available and, as a result, these lim-
itations should be adjusted for certain
plants in this industry. An individual
discharger or other interested person
may submit evidence to the Regional
Administrator (or to the State, if the
State has the authority to issue NPDES
permits) that factors relating to the
equipment or facilities involved, the proc-
ess applied, or other such factors re-
lated to such discharger are funda-
mentally different from the factors con-
sidered in the establIshmeht of the
guidelines. On the basis of such evidence
or other available information, the Re-
gional Administrator (or the State) wll
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make a written flnding that such factors
are or are not fundamentally different
for that facility compared to those
specified in the Development Document.
If such fundamentally different factors
are found to exist, the Regional Admin-
istrator or the State shall establish for
the discharger effluent limitations in the
NPDES permit either more or less strin-
gent than the limitations established
herein, to the extent dictated by sich
fundamentally different factors. Such
limitations must be approved by the Ad-
ministrator of the Environmental Pro-
tecUon Agency. The Administrator may
approve or disapprove such limitations,
specify other limitations, or initiate pro-
ceedings to revise these regulations.

(b) The following limitations estab-
lish the quantity or quality of pollu-
tants or pollutant properties, controlled
by this section, which may be discharged
by a point source subject to the provi-
sions of this subpart after application of
the best practicable control technology
currently available:

Emalent l1nlta!1ors:

E ffuint Average of
cllu.ZtczTk2 WMaximum fa- daly val es for

any 1 day 30 ccuycutive
days shall ratexcd-

lfztnte units kg/kkg prcce-ed
TS- ........... 2.CZ L 30
Chrumium totaL... .CZ .,

p ................. Within the range 6.0 to 9.0

Er!sh un1ts rb,tcn prccctcd

T S ............. 5.310 z Ct,
Chmnlum t tal... . SCG .G:3
1?wwao tcaL.. 1.34
pl . Within the range 0.0 to 9.v

§ 424.33 Effluent limitations guideline
representing the degree of effluent
reduction attainable by the applica-
tion of the best available technology
economically achievable.

The following limitations establish the
quantity or quality of pollutants or pollu-
tant properties, controlled by this sec-
tion. which may be discharged by a
point source subject to the provisions of
this subpart after application of the best
available technology economically
achievable:

Efflunt Avcrage of
CharvztC&tfs daily ralur-s

.amum ftn for 20
ay I day cors-ecw!ve

days shall

Mdrc unit3
kqj~kkq pzcocsmA

S.. .. 0221 0.138
Chromium tctaL... .CA .CC27

Pit .......... Within the rarg .0 to 9.0

Ea units Thfta
prccezaed

TSa......... 0.2 0.271
Chromium tc4tnL .02 .CCS4
frngat. ec totaL.- .103 .CZ4

PH-- --.. Within the ra.za -0 to 9.0
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§ 424.34 [Reserved]
§ 424.35 Standards of performance for

new sources.
The following standards of perform-

ance establish the quantity or quality
of pollutants or 'pollutant properties,
controlled by this section, which may be
discharged by a new source subject to
the provisions of this subpart:

Effluent liniltations

Efiluent • m - Average of
characteristio Maximum for daily values for

any I day 30 consecutive
days shall not

exceed-

Metric units kg/kkg processed
TSS ---------------- 0.271 0.136
Chromium total. ... .0054 .0027
Manganese total.... . .054 .027
pH -------------- Within the range 6.0 to O.0

English units lb/ton processed

TSS ---------------- 0.542 0.271
Chromium total. --- 011 .0054

HManganes total_ ... t the .054pIL-------- Within the range 6.0 to 9.0

§ 424.36 Pretreatment standards for
new source,

The pretreatment standards under
section 307(c) of the Act for a source
within the slag processing subcategory,
which is a user of a publicly owned treat-
ment works (and which would be a new
sburce subject to section 306 of the Act,
if It were to discharge pollutants to the
navigable waters), shall be the standard
set forth in Part 128 of this chapter, ex-
cept that, for the purpose of this section,
§ 128.133 of this chapter, shall be
amended to read as follows:

In addition to the prohibitions set forth
In 40 CFR 128.131, the pretreatment stand-
ard for incompatible pollutants introduced
Into a publicly owned treatment works shall
be the standard of performance for now
sources specified in 40 CFR 424.35; provided
that, if the publicly owned treatment works
which receives the pollutants is committed,
in its NPDES permit, to remove a spcifled
percentage of any Incompatible pollutant,
the pretreatment standard applicable to
users of such treatment works shall, except
in the case of standards providing for no
discharge of pollutants, be correspondingly
reduced in stringency for that pollutant.

[FR Doc.74-3718 Filed 2-21-74;8:45 am]

FEDERAL REGISTER, VOL. 39, NO. 37-FRIDAY, FEBRUARY 22, 1974


